

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT JOINT PURCHASING

SCHOOL MEDICAL SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING										
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	MOORE ITEM #	NUMBER ORDERED	EVERYTHING MEDICAL	HENRY SCHEIN	MEDCO SUPPLY	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	QUILL
1	ADHESIVE BANDAGES, FLEXIBLE FABRIC STRIPS, 1" X 3", 100/BX		BOX	68181	43	1.39	1.18	2.14	NO BID	5.13
2	ADHESIVE BANDAGES, FLEXIBLE FABRIC FINGERTIP, 100/BX		BOX	68183	1	2.95	6.32	3.60	NO BID	NO BID
3	ADHESIVE BANDAGES, FLEXIBLE FABRIC KNUCKLE, 1 1/2" X 3", 100/BX		BOX	68184	1	2.85	2.41	3.79	NO BID	NO BID
4	ADHESIVE BANDAGES, FLEXIBLE FABRIC X-LARGE, 2" X 4", 100/BX		BOX	68185	7	2.90	4.37	3.26	NO BID	NO BID
5	ADHESIVE BANDAGES, FLEXIBLE FABRIC JUNIOR, 3/8" X 1 1/2", 100/BX		BOX	68273	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
6	ADHESIVE BANDAGES, SHEER PLASTIC SPOT, 7/8", 100/BX		BOX	31405	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
7	ADHESIVE BANDAGES, SHEER PLASTIC BUTTERFLY MEDIUM, 1 5/8" X 3/8", 100/BX		BOX	68207	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
8	NON-ADHERING STERILE GAUZE PADS 2" X 3", 100/PKG		PKG	10775	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
9	NON-ADHERING STERILE GAUZE PADS 3" X 4", 100/PKG		PKG	10776	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
10	STERILE GAUZE PADS, LATEX-FREE 4" X 4", 100/BX		BOX	08252	1	4.75	5.82	5.79	NO BID	NO BID
11	CONFORMING STRETCH BANDAGE, NON-STERILE 2" X 4.1 YDS, 12/BX		BOX	63361	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
12	WOUND WASH SALINE SPRAY, 7 OZ.		EACH	69128	2	4.49	5.43	6.12	NO BID	4.22
							7.4 oz.			7.1 oz
13	ALCOHOL PREP PADS, STERILE, 100/BOX		BOX	96959	18	0.84	1.75	1.15	NO BID	2.04

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT JOINT PURCHASING

SCHOOL MEDICAL SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING										
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	MOORE ITEM #	NUMBER ORDERED	EVERYTHING MEDICAL	HENRY SCHEIN	MEDCO SUPPLY	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	QUILL
14	AQUAPHOR HEALING OINTMENT, 1.75 OZ. TUBE		EACH	67292	7	5.70	4.40	4.58	NO BID	NO BID
15	HYDROGEN PEROXIDE, 16 OZ. BOTTLE		BTL	92997	4	0.63	1.14	0.77	NO BID	NO BID
16	STING RELIEF WIPES, 2% LIDOCAINE/50% ETHYL ALCOHOL, 100/BX		BOX	77499	1	4.49	15.70	6.15	NO BID	NO BID
							10/box @ 1.57	150/box		
17	COTTON BALLS, MEDIUM, 2000/CASE		CASE	92796	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
18	APPLICATOR, COTTON TIP, 6", 1000/BOX		BOX	68360	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
19	TONGUE DEPRESSORS, ADULT, 500/BOX		BOX	69617	1	4.39	5.96	4.93	NO BID	4.82
20	VASELINE, 3.5 OZ JAR		EACH	93089	4	1.19	1.13	2.22	NO BID	NO BID
						goodsense 3.75 oz	vaseline 3.5 oz tube	vaseline 3.75 oz		
21	LYSOL DISINFECTANT SPRAY, ORIGINAL, 19 OZ CAN		CAN	89458	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
22	BETADINE SOLUTION, 10% POVIDONE-IODINE, 8 OZ BTL		BTL	90692	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
23	KLEENEX FACIAL TISSUE, 2-PLY WHITE, 100/BX, 36/CASE	NO SUBS	CASE	91750	7	50.95	40.68	56.00	50.99	49.12
24	CRAMER BLISTER KIT - 25 PADS PER PACK		PKG		5	8.70	8.93	17.42	NO BID	NO BID
						mueller	mueller	cramer		
25	NEW SPONGE, NONSTERILE, 2" X 2", 4-PLY, 200/BAG		BAG	74082	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT JOINT PURCHASING

SCHOOL MEDICAL SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING										
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	MOORE ITEM #	NUMBER ORDERED	EVERYTHING MEDICAL	HENRY SCHEIN	MEDCO SUPPLY	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	QUILL
26	SANITARY NAPKINS, 250/BOX		BOX	65595	2	32.90	41.33	35.30	29.98	29.29
						gards	stayfree	maxithins	gards	maxithins
27	SANITARY TAMPONS, 500/BOX		BOX	14208	2	59.95	54.21	75.83	53.98	59.84
						tampax	tampax	tampax	tampax	tampax
28	PILLOW COVERS, TISSUE/POLY, WHITE, 21" X 30", 100/BX		BOX	77009	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
29	PAPER MEDICINE CUPS, 1 OZ., 250/BOX		BOX	55579	20	3.15	2.24	3.63	NO BID	NO BID
30	MEDICINE CUPS LATEX FREE, 1 OZ., 100/PKG		PKG	81772	11	0.73	1.24	0.95	NO BID	1.54
31	PAPER COLD DRINKING CUPS, FIRM TO TOUCH, 5 OZ., 100/PKG		PKG	89724	100	2.29	4.86	5.83	3.29	5.54
32	PLEATED PAPER CUPS, 3 5 OZ, 100/PKG		PKG	90003	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
33	SALINE SOLUTION FOR EYES, 12 OZ. BOTTLE		BTL		6	3.20	3.81	3.68	NO BID	NO BID
						bausch & lomb				
34	MULTIPURPOSE SOLUTION FOR EYES, 4 OZ. BOTTLE		BTL		4	3.49	2.50	4.37	NO BID	NO BID
						goodsense				
35	CONTACT LENS CASE		EACH	90076	7	0.82	1.06	0.72	NO BID	NO BID
36	VISINE ORIGINAL EYE DROPS, 5 OZ. BOTTLE		BTL	92742	1	3.09	3.36	4.21	NO BID	NO BID
37	REFRESH FOR CONTACTS, 12mL BOTTLE		BTL	91005	3	5.95	6.31	4.06	NO BID	NO BID
						refresh	refresh	.5 oz visine		
38	EYE IRRIGATION SOLUTION, 4 OZ. BTL, REUSABLE, NOT ONE TIME USE		BTL	75519	4	1.95	2.50	2.56	NO BID	NO BID

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT JOINT PURCHASING

SCHOOL MEDICAL SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING										
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	MOORE ITEM #	NUMBER ORDERED	EVERYTHING MEDICAL	HENRY SCHEIN	MEDCO SUPPLY	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	QUILL
39	EYEGLOSS REPAIR KIT		EACH	81300	4	0.99	1.71	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
40	BABY WIPES, UNSCENTED, 80/PACK		PKG	96642	11	1.85	2.24	2.28	1.99	NO BID
41	SANI-CLOTH PLUS GERMICIDAL DISP WIPES, 6" X 6.75", 160/CAN		EACH	62879	5	5.39	4.79	6.04	7.39	5.83
									200/can	
42	JERGENS LOTION, 10 OZ., INDICATE ORIG or ULTRA HEALING		EACH	91356	4	3.95	4.17	3.87	NO BID	NO BID
						original	original	vaseline intensive care		
43	COUGH DROPS, CHERRY, 100/BOX OR BAG		BOX	94624	100	0.72	4.96	3.39	NO BID	NO BID
						30/bag	125/box	75/box		
44	COUGH DROPS, SUGAR FREE MENTHOL, 25/PKG		PKG		0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
45	CHLORASEPTIC SPRAY, CHERRY, 6 OZ.		EACH	36564	5	4.75	5.14	5.43	NO BID	NO BID
46	TUMS, FRUIT FLAVORED ONLY, 150 BTL	NO SUBS	BTL		6	4.95	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
47	IBUPROFEN, 200 MG, 250 PACKS WITH 2 IN EACH		PKG	89954	5	4.75	11.87	12.42	NO BID	32.51
48	TYLENOL CHEWABLE, 80 MG, FRUIT, 30 TBLTS/BTL		BTL	64134	9	1.69	1.12	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
						generic	aspirin			
49	TYLENOL TABLETS, 325 MG, 100/BTL		BTL	83277	9	0.96	7.82	1.09	NO BID	NO BID
						generic	tylenol	feneric		
50	TYLENOL ELIXIR, 4 OZ. BTL		BTL	20688	5	1.29	1.55	6.59	NO BID	NO BID
						generic	generic	tylenol		

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT JOINT PURCHASING

SCHOOL MEDICAL SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING										
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	MOORE ITEM #	NUMBER ORDERED	EVERYTHING MEDICAL	HENRY SCHEIN	MEDCO SUPPLY	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	QUILL
51	DIPHEN CAPLETS, 25 MG, 24/PKG		PKG	60359	1	1.65	2.21	7.91	NO BID	NO BID
								200/pkg		
52	BENADRYL ELIXER, 4 OZ. BTL		BTL		3	1.19	0.99	1.67	NO BID	NO BID
						generic	generic	generic		
53	THERMOSCAN PROBE COVERS, 200/BOX		BOX	76803	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
54	DISPOSABLE PROBE COVERS FOR ORAL THERMOMETER, 250/BX		BOX	53867	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
55	DISPOSABLE PENLIGHTS, 6/PKG		PKG	81237	3	3.75	3.84	4.29	NO BID	10.37
56	LICE COMB, ALL METAL		EACH		0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
57	CITRACE GERMICIDAL DEODORIZER , 14 OZ. SPRAY CAN		EACH	88921	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
58	CALAMINE LOTION, 6 OZ.		EACH	14823	2	1.29	2.64	1.31	NO BID	NO BID
59	CLINICAL CARE BENZALKONIUM CHLORIDE, 16 OZ. BTL		BTL	92852	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
60	3-PLY MULTI PURPOSE TISSUE PROFESSIONAL TOWELS, WHITE, 13" X 18", 500/CS		CASE	77001	1	14.95	20.30	21.45	NO BID	35.25
61	WHIZZER CLEANER & DISINFECTANT		GAL	97498	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
62	COLD OR HOT REUSABLE, FLEX GEL PK, 6 1/2" X 7 3/4"		EACH	79453	1	0.70	2.07	0.93	NO BID	NO BID
						6x8	6x9	6x8		
63	INSTANT COLD COMPRESS, 5 1/2" X 7", 24/CASE		CASE	79451	2	8.95	11.99	14.48	NO BID	NO BID
						48/cs	48/cs	5x6, 50/cs		

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT JOINT PURCHASING

SCHOOL MEDICAL SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING										
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	MOORE ITEM #	NUMBER ORDERED	EVERYTHING MEDICAL	HENRY SCHEIN	MEDCO SUPPLY	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	QUILL
64	INSTANT COLD COMPRESS, 4 X 4, 10/PKG		PKG	79450	2	4.90	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
						3x5				
65	ACE WRAP, 3" X 5 YDS, 10 CT/BOX		BOX	08881	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
66	ACE WRAP, 4" X 5 YDS, 10 CT/BOX		BOX	08882	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
67	POWERFLEX, BLACK, 2" X 6 YDS, 24 /CASE		CASE	97545	10	32.90	28.73	28.57	NO BID	NO BID
68	COACH POROUS ATHLETIC TAPE, WHITE, 1 1/2" X 15', 32/CS		CASE	48293	6	59.50	55.66	61.30	NO BID	NO BID
69	COBAN LF SELF-ADHERENT WRAP, LATEX FREE, NON-STERILE, 2" X 5', 36/CS		CASE	93051	2	35.50	65.90	75.46	NO BID	85.44
						generic				