

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT JOINT PURCHASING

PAPER/TECH SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING					CONTRACT PAPER GROUP	KURTZ BROS.	QUILL CORP	STANDARD STATIONERY	W.B. MASON
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	NUMBER ORDERED					
1	COPY PAPER, HAMMERMILL FORE or EQUAL, 8 1/2 X 11, WHITE 92 BRT, SUB 20, 10 RMS/CTN	SPECIFY BRIGHTNESS	CTN	1664	29.89	NO BID	34.99	NO BID	27.73
2	COPY PAPER 8 1/2 X 11, BLUE, SUB 20, 10 RMS/CTN		CTN	9	39.80	46.80	46.10	NO BID	35.20
3	COPY PAPER 8 1/2 X 11, GOLDENROD, SUB 20, 10 RMS/CTN		CTN	12	39.80	46.80	46.10	NO BID	35.20
4	COPY PAPER 8 1/2 X 11, GREEN, SUB 20, 10 RMS/CTN		CTN	16	39.80	46.80	46.10	NO BID	35.20
5	COPY PAPER 8 1/2 X 11, PINK, SUB 20, 10 RMS/CTN		CTN	8	39.80	46.80	46.10	NO BID	35.20
6	COPY PAPER 8 1/2 X 11, CANARY, SUB 20, 10 RMS/CTN		CTN	6	39.80	46.80	46.10	NO BID	35.20
7	COPY PAPER 8 1/2 X 11, IVORY, SUB 20, 10 RMS/CTN		CTN	6	39.80	46.80	46.10	NO BID	35.20
8	COPY PAPER 8 1/2 X 11, SALMON, SUB 20, 10 RMS/CTN		CTN	9	39.80	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	35.20
9	COPY PAPER 8 1/2 X 11, GRAY, SUB 20, 10 RMS/CTN		CTN	1	39.80	46.80	46.10	NO BID	35.20
10	COPY PAPER 8 1/2 X 11, ULTRA LIME, 10 RMS/CTN		CTN	1	60.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	62.30
11	COPY PAPER 8 1/2 X 11, ULTRA FUSCHIA, 10 RMS/CTN		CTN	1	60.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	87.80
12	COPY PAPER 8 1/2 X 11, ULTRA GRAPE, 10 RMS/CTN		CTN	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
13	COPY PAPER 8 1/2 X 11, SEA BLUE, 10 RMS/CTN		CTN	1	60.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	87.80
14	COPY PAPER, HAMMERMILL FORE or EQUAL, 8 1/2 X 14, WHITE 92 BRT or BETTER, SUB 20, 10 RMS/CTN	SPECIFY BRIGHTNESS	CTN	2	44.00	NO BID	56.13	NO BID	38.23
15	COPY PAPER 8 1/2 X 14, BLUE, SUB 20, 10 RMS/CTN		CTN	1	80.00	NO BID	56.80	NO BID	58.80
16	3 HOLE PUNCH COPY PAPER, HAMMERMILL FORE or EQUAL, 8 1/2 X 11, WHITE, 92 BRT, SUB 20, 10 RMS/CTN	SPECIFY BRIGHTNESS	CTN	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
17	CARD STOCK 8 1/2 X 11--65LB, BRIGHT YELLOW, 8 RMS/CTN		CTN	1	57.55	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	96.90
18	CARD STOCK 8 1/2 X 11--65LB, , BRIGHT RED, 8 RMS/CTN		CTN	1	57.55	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	92.90
19	CARD STOCK 8 1/2 X 11--65LB, BRIGHT BLUE, 8 RMS/CTN		CTN	1	57.55	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	96.80
20	CARD STOCK 8 1/2 X 11--65LB, BRIGHT GOLD, 8 RMS/CTN		CTN	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
21	CARD STOCK 8 1/2 X 11--65LB, BRIGHT GREEN, 8 RMS/CTN		CTN	1	57.55	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	99.80
22	CARD STOCK 8 1/2 X 11--65LB, WHITE, 92 BRT, 10 RMS/CTN	SPECIFY BRIGHTNESS	CTN	6	69.30	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	58.13

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT JOINT PURCHASING

PAPER/TECH SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING					CONTRACT PAPER GROUP	KURTZ BROS.	QUILL CORP	STANDARD STATIONERY	W.B. MASON
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	NUMBER ORDERED					
23	CD-R 700MB, 50 PK SPINDLE	SPECIFY BRAND	PKG	2	NO BID	14.95	8.58	NO BID	12.88
						data memory	verbatim		innovera
24	CD-RW 700MB, 50 PK SPINDLE	SPECIFY BRAND	PKG	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
25	DVD-R 4.7GB, 25 PK SPINDLE	SPECIFY BRAND	PKG	13	NO BID	12.03	7.54	NO BID	9.44
						data memory	verbatim		maxell
26	CD JEWEL CASE		EACH	70	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
27	USB FLASH DRIVE 2.0 - 4GB	SPECIFY BRAND	EACH	44	NO BID	5.94	3.36	3.47	5.69
						data memory	V7		verbatim
28	USB FLASH DRIVE 2.0 - 8GB	SPECIFY BRAND	EACH	6	NO BID	5.88	3.66	3.78	7.62
						dexxon digital	V7		verbatim
29	USB FLASH DRIVE 2.0 - 16GB	SPECIFY BRAND	EACH	19	NO BID	7.19	6.67	3.93	7.84
						dexxon digital	verbatim		verbatim
30	USB FLASH DRIVE 2.0 - 32GB	SPECIFY BRAND	EACH	39	NO BID	10.58	8.12	NO BID	12.03
						dexxon digital	verbatim		verbatim