

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT JOINT PURCHASING

GENERAL SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING													
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	KURTZ NO.	NUMBER ORDERED	CASCADE SCHOOL SUPPLIES	KURTZ BROS	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	QUILL CORP	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	STANDARD STATIONERY	W.B. MASON
1	NO. 802 MODERN CLASS RECORD BOOK 8 1/2" X 11", NINE WEEKS	SUBMIT SAMPLE	EACH	01603	15	4.13	1.14	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	2.47
2	PENCIL PADS NO COVER 8" X 10", 3/8" RULED, 100 SHTS/TBLT, 100 TBLT/CTN		CTN	01054	5	102.00	64.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
3	COMPOSITION BOOKS, (SEWN), 10 1/2" X 8", 72 PAGES, 12 DZ/CTN		CTN	01427	8	84.84	63.48	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	52.89
4	COMPOSITION BOOKS, (SEWN), 8 1/2" X 7", 48 PAGES, 12 DZ/CTN		CTN	01401	3	27.36	40.56	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	30.24
5	THEME TABLETS 3/8" RULED, 10 1/2" X 8", 140 PAGES, 72 TBLT/CTN		CTN	01101	3	NO BID	50.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
6	EXECUTIVE LEGAL PADS, YELLOW 8 1/2" X 11 3/4", 12 PDS/PKG		PKG	01304	8	7.23	6.55	NO BID	NO BID	10.08	NO BID	NO BID	4.98
7	EXECUTIVE LEGAL PADS, WHITE 8 1/2" X 11 3/4", 12 PDS/PKG		PKG	01324	5	6.92	6.57	NO BID	NO BID	9.37	NO BID	NO BID	4.98
8	EXECUTIVE LEGAL PADS, YELLOW 5" X 8", 12 PDS/PKG		PKG	01303	5	3.46	4.56	NO BID	NO BID	4.60	NO BID	NO BID	2.64
9	EXECUTIVE LEGAL PADS, WHITE 5" X 8", 12 PDS/PKG		PKG	01320	7	3.93	4.69	NO BID	NO BID	4.71	NO BID	NO BID	2.64
10	NOTEBOOK PAPER, 8 1/2" X 11", 3/8" RULED, 5 HOLES 500 SHT/RM, 10 RMS/CTN		CTN	02525	3	35.63	27.50	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	53.28
11	COMPOSITION PAPER, WHITE MARGINAL RULED 8" X 10 1/2", 10 RMS/CTN		CTN	02406	4	29.70	26.70	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	23.00
12	CONSTRUCTION PAPER, STND ASST COLORS (10) 9" X 12", 100 SHTS/PKG		PKG	36098	67	1.45	1.28	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	2.08	NO BID	1.14
13	CONSTRUCTION PAPER, DARK BROWN 12" X 18", 100 SHTS/PKG		PKG	36117	7	2.99	2.54	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3.84	NO BID	2.55
14	CONSTRUCTION PAPER, RED 12" X 18", 100 SHTS/PKG		PKG	36120	11	2.97	2.54	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3.84	NO BID	2.84
15	CONSTRUCTION PAPER, BLUE 12" X 18", 100 SHTS/PKG		PKG	36130	8	2.99	2.53	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3.84	NO BID	2.08
16	CONSTRUCTION PAPER, DARK BLUE 12" X 18", 100 SHTS/PKG		PKG	36132	3	2.97	2.54	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3.84	NO BID	2.27
17	CONSTRUCTION PAPER, GREEN 12" X 18", 100 SHTS/PKG		PKG	36143	13	2.99	2.53	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3.84	NO BID	2.08
18	CONSTRUCTION PAPER, DARK GREEN 12" X 18", 100 SHTS/PKG		PKG	36142	1	2.99	2.54	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3.68	NO BID	NO BID
19	CONSTRUCTION PAPER, YELLOW 12" X 18", 100 SHTS/PKG		PKG	36150	12	2.97	2.53	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3.84	NO BID	2.08
20	CONSTRUCTION PAPER, ORANGE 12" X 18", 100 SHTS/PKG		PKG	36160	8	2.99	2.55	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3.84	NO BID	2.54

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT JOINT PURCHASING

GENERAL SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING													
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	KURTZ NO.	NUMBER ORDERED	CASCADE SCHOOL SUPPLIES	KURTZ BROS	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	QUILL CORP	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	STANDARD STATIONERY	W.B. MASON
21	CONSTRUCTION PAPER, BLACK 12" X 18", 100 SHTS/PKG		PKG	36181	12	2.99	2.55	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3.84	NO BID	2.27
22	CONSTRUCTION PAPER, VIOLET 12" X 18", 100 SHTS/PKG		PKG	36170	6	2.99	2.55	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3.84	NO BID	2.08
23	CONSTRUCTION PAPER, WHITE 12" X 18", 100 SHTS/PKG		PKG	36180	3	2.99	2.53	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3.84	NO BID	2.51
24	CONSTRUCTION PAPER, PINK 12" X 18", 100 SHTS/PKG		PKG	36121	10	2.99	2.55	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3.84	NO BID	2.08
25	CONSTRUCTION PAPER, ASST COLORS 12" X 18", 100 SHTS/PKG		PKG	36199	9	2.99	3.16	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	3.84	NO BID	2.49
26	SCISSORS, BLUNT, 5" LEFT OR RIGHT, 12/PKG		PKG	10330	4	7.55	18.54	NO BID	3.19	7.77	16.49	2.37	5.69
27	SCISSORS, OFFICE, 7"		EACH	10340	23	0.99	1.94	NO BID	0.59	1.55	3.29	0.46	0.85
28	DUAL POCKET PORTFOLIO, 9" X 12", BLUE, 25/BX		BOX	17222	30	2.78	2.66	NO BID	NO BID	6.03	7.03	2.47	3.87
29	DUAL POCKET PORTFOLIO, 9" X 12", ASST COLORS, 25/BX		BOX	17223	76	3.07	2.93	NO BID	NO BID	6.05	7.03	NO BID	20.57
30	FILE FOLDER, 1/3 CUT LETTER SZ, MANILLA 100/BX, 5 BX/CTN		CTN	13213	15	104.00	26.45	NO BID	NO BID	29.00	31.85	NO BID	32.50
31	FILE FOLDER, 1/3 CUT LETTER SZ, ASST COLORS 100/BX, 5 BX/CTN (BLUE,R,Y,O,GRN)		CTN	13265	9	131.00	32.50	NO BID	NO BID	72.50	135.55	NO BID	36.20
32	HANGING FILE FOLDERS, 1/5 CUT LETTER SZ, 25/BX		BOX	13225	12	6.51	4.68	NO BID	NO BID	5.80	8.08	NO BID	3.81
33	SWINGLINE STAPLER 747	NO SUBS	EACH	11010	5	12.19	12.65	7.18	6.99	11.12	NO BID	NO BID	6.72
34	SWINGLINE STAPLES - 5,000 P/BX	NO SUBS	BOX	11102	49	0.93	2.28	0.70	0.63	2.16	3.07	0.63	0.57
35	BINDER CLIPS, 3/8" CAPACITY, 12/BX		BOX	03442	59	0.36	0.20	NO BID	0.19	0.23	0.37	0.16	0.17
36	BINDER CLIPS, 5/8" CAPACITY, 12/BX		BOX	11420	57	0.59	0.54	NO BID	0.40	0.67	NO BID	0.33	0.53
37	BINDER CLIPS, 1" CAPACITY, 12/BX		BOX	11418	36	1.17	1.34	NO BID	0.95	1.65	2.80	0.82	1.14
38	GEM PAPER CLIPS, 1 1/4", 100/BX		BOX	11401	39	0.32	0.16	NO BID	0.17	0.63	NO BID	0.14	1.39
39	GIANT GEM PAPER CLIPS, 2", 100/BX		BOX	11405	33	0.57	0.45	NO BID	0.40	0.98	NO BID	NO BID	3.99
40	ENVELOPES, CLASP, 6" X 9", 100/BX		BOX	17045	6	5.37	5.12	NO BID	NO BID	11.77	8.79	NO BID	4.43

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT JOINT PURCHASING

GENERAL SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING						CASCADE SCHOOL SUPPLIES	KURTZ BROS	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	QUILL CORP	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	STANDARD STATIONERY	W B. MASON
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	KURTZ NO.	NUMBER ORDERED								
41	ENVELOPES, CLASP, 9" X 12", 100/BX		BOX	17051	7	7.15	6.77	NO BID	NO BID	16.47	9.89	6.80	5.96
42	ENVELOPES, CLASP, 12" X 15 1/2", 100/BX		BOX	17055	1	11.06	10.61	NO BID	NO BID	25.11	18.14	NO BID	9.82
43	ENVELOPES, CLASP, 10" X 13", 100/BX		BOX	17053	8	8.19	8.01	NO BID	NO BID	19.62	NO BID	7.38	6.87
44	ENVELOPES, WHITE 24 LB., NO. 10, 4 1/8" X 9 1/2", 500/BX		BOX	17004	2	8.31	7.56	NO BID	NO BID	18.84	NO BID	NO BID	7.45
45	ENVELOPES, WHITE 24 LB., NO. 6 3/4, 3 5/8" X 6 1/2", 500/BX		BOX	17002	12	6.03	6.38	NO BID	NO BID	13.92	10.99	6.28	6.87
46	ENVELOPES, WINDOW #10, 4 1/8" X 9 1/2", 500/BX		BOX	17022	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
47	TAPE, SCOTCH TRANSPARENT 1/2" X 1296", NO. 600	NO SUBS	ROLL	12001	34	1.38	1.52	1.04	1.01	1.56	1.81	1.01	1.08
48	TAPE, SCOTCH TRANSPARENT 3/4" X 1296", NO. 600	NO SUBS	ROLL	12002	98	1.86	2.06	1.20	1.30	2.03	1.91	1.28	1.25
49	TAPE, MASKING, SCOTCH 1/2" X 60 YDS NO. 234	NO SUBS	ROLL	12107	18	3.68	4.59	3.70	3.26	NO BID	4.67	NO BID	3.47
50	TAPE, MASKING, SCOTCH 3/4" X 60 YDS NO. 234	NO SUBS	ROLL	12108	39	4.81	6.10	5.46	4.49	6.58	6.21	NO BID	4.55
51	TAPE, MASKING, SCOTCH 1" X 60 YDS NO. 234	NO SUBS	ROLL	12109	70	5.94	7.63	7.06	6.59	6.55	7.68	NO BID	5.36
52	TAPE, MASKING, SCOTCH 2" X 60 YDS NO. 234	NO SUBS	ROLL	12110	47	11.58	15.27	13.80	13.09	12.72	15.39	NO BID	9.96
53	SCOTCH HEAVY DUTY SHIPPING CLEAR TAPE W/ REFILL DISP, 1.88" X 54.6 YD, 3.1 MIL	NO SUBS	EACH	12025	37	2.37	32.70	NO BID	4.39	NO BID	38.27	NO BID	3.24
						2"X800"	disp w/6 rls				disp w/6 rls		1.88"x22.2 yds
54	GLUE STICKS, .77 OZ. - ELMERS		EACH	18181	46	0.76	0.86	0.65	0.65	0.97	0.70	NO BID	0.27
						elmers	elmers	elmers	elmers	elmers	elmers		universal
55	GLUE STICKS, 1.4 OZ.	SPECIFY BRAND	EACH	18179	496	0.34	1.80	NO BID	0.38	2.26	2.08	NO BID	0.36
						1.3 oz-cascade	UHU		leonard	ross	UHU		universal
56	GLUE, ELMERS, 4 OZ. PLASTIC SQUEEZE BTL		BTL	18153	23	0.87	0.68	NO BID	0.45	0.82	0.86	0.64	0.59
						elmers	elmers		leonard	elmers	elmers	elmers	leonard
57	GLUE ALL, ELMERS, 16 OZ. PLASTIC SQUEEZE BTL		BTL	18088	3	3.51	3.73	NO BID	2.95	NO BID	3.51	3.27	3.29
						elmers	all purpose glue 2.23				elmers	elmers	elmers
58	GLUE ALL, ELMERS, GALLON JUG		GAL	18090	4	12.02	12.42	NO BID	8.95	15.18	12.09	10.95	10.05
						elmers	all purpose glue 10.67		leonard	elmers	elmers	elmers	leonard
59	PENS, FINE POINT - BLUE, DZ	SPECIFY BRAND	DOZ	08117	18	1.07	1.83	NO BID	0.84	1.25	0.86	0.60	0.76
						bic	bic		papermate	bic	school smart	stick writer	universal

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT JOINT PURCHASING

GENERAL SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING						CASCADE SCHOOL SUPPLIES	KURTZ BROS	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	QUILL CORP	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	STANDARD STATIONERY	W B. MASON
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	KURTZ NO.	NUMBER ORDERED								
60	PENS, FINE POINT - BLACK, DZ	SPECIFY BRAND	DOZ	08118	22	1.09	1.83	NO BID	0.84	1.14	0.86	0.60	0.76
						bic	bic		papermate	bic	school smart	stick writer	universal
61	PENS, FINE POINT - RED, DZ	SPECIFY BRAND	DOZ	08119	18	1.01	1.83	NO BID	0.84	2.31	0.86	0.60	0.93
						papermate	bic		papermate	bic	school smart	stick writer	papermate
62	PENS, MEDIUM POINT-BLUE, DZ	SPECIFY BRAND	DOZ	08590	10	1.07	1.88	NO BID	0.84	1.29	0.86	NO BID	0.76
						bic	bic		papermate	bic	school smart		universal
63	PENS, MEDIUM POINT-BLACK, DZ	SPECIFY BRAND	DOZ	08591	13	1.09	1.88	NO BID	0.84	1.38	0.86	NO BID	0.76
						bic	bic		papermate	bic	school smart		universal
64	PENS, MEDIUM POINT-RED, DZ	SPECIFY BRAND	DOZ	08592	12	1.07	1.88	NO BID	0.84	1.31	0.86	0.60	0.76
						bic	bic		papermate	bic	school smart	stick writer	universal
65	PENCILS W/ERASER NO. 2, 10 GR/CTN	SPECIFY BRAND	CTN	06025	9	66.02	66.00	NO BID	78.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	75.58
						dixon	kurtz		dixon				universal
66	PENCILS - TICONDEROGA W/ERASER NO. 2, 10 GR/CTN	NO SUBS	CTN	06044	3	159.80	226.80	NO BID	162.00	NO BID	NO BID	143.13	153.60
67	PENCILS, PRIMARY LADDIE W/ERASER, GRS		GRS	06117	4	36.50	38.52	NO BID	25.08	NO BID	57.84	23.05	28.08
											bid 4 82 ca		
68	SHARPIE MARKER (or EQUAL) - FINE PT - RED, DZ	SPECIFY BRAND	DOZ	08494	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
69	SHARPIE MARKER (or EQUAL) - FINE PT - BLACK, DZ	SPECIFY BRAND	DOZ	08501	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
70	SHARPIE MARKER (or EQUAL) - FINE PT - BLUE, DZ	SPECIFY BRAND	DOZ	08498	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
71	SHARPIE MARKER SETS - FINE PT - (G,BL,R,BLK)	SPECIFY BRAND	SET	08241	25	3.12	2.83	2.40	2.49	4.59	NO BID	1.97	1.94
						sharpie	sharpie		sharpie	sharpie			sharpie
72	SHARPIE MARKER (or EQUAL) - CHISEL TIP - RED, DZ	SPECIFY BRAND	EACH	08713	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
73	SHARPIE MARKER (or EQUAL) - CHISEL TIP - BLACK, DZ	SPECIFY BRAND	EACH	08712	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
74	EXPO/BIC (or EQUAL) - DRY ERASE MARKERS - FINE TIP SET (G,BL,R,BLK)	SPECIFY BRAND	SET	08013	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
75	EXPO/BIC (or EQUAL) - DRY ERASE MARKERS - CHISEL TIP SET (G,BL,R,BLK)	SPECIFY BRAND	SET	08176	65	3.11	3.71	2.70	1.09	3.15	3.51	NO BID	1.25
						expo	expo	expo	leonard	expo	bic		universal
76	EXPO II (or EQUAL) - WHITE BOARD CLEANER - 8 OZ.	SPECIFY BRAND	EACH	09450	31	2.31	2.49	NO BID	1.69	2.14	2.46	0.95	1.44
						expo	expo		expo	expo	expo	whiteboard wiza	expo

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT JOINT PURCHASING

GENERAL SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING													
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	KURTZ NO.	NUMBER ORDERED	CASCADE SCHOOL SUPPLIES	KURTZ BROS	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	QUILL CORP	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	STANDARD STATIONERY	W.B. MASON
77	EXPO (or EQUAL) TOWELETTES WHITE BOARD CLEANER, 50/CONT	SPECIFY BRAND	EACH	09423	4	5.56	6.35	NO BID	4.49	4.93	7.20	NO BID	4.05
						expo	expo		expo	expo	expo		universal
78	LRG CRAYONS/TUCK BX, CRYOLA or EQUAL, KNDG SZ, 4" X 7/16" SIX STND CLRS + B/BLK		DOZ	43034	10	18.56	16.80	12.90	7.80	NO BID	6.36	NO BID	12.00
						crayola	crayola	crayola	prang		crayola not LARGE bid 53 ea		crayola
79	STANDARD SARGENT CRAYONS 3 5/8" X 5/16", EIGHT COLORS IN TUCK BOX		DOZ	47001	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
80	STANDARD SARGENT CRAYONS 3 5/8" X 5/16", SIXTEEN COLORS IN TUCK BOX		DOZ	47005	3	5.50	5.28	NO BID	5.52	NO BID	NO BID	4.62	4.93
									prang				
81	DRAWING PAPER, SNOW WHITE, 9" X 12", 60 LB.		REAM	35006	4	6.60	6.01	NO BID	NO BID	8.92	9.62	NO BID	5.10
										pacon			
82	DRAWING PAPER, SNOW WHITE, 18" X 24", 60 LB.		REAM	35009	3	26.37	24.16	NO BID	NO BID	37.46	34.31	NO BID	20.66
										pacon			
83	POSTER BOARD, WHITE, 22" X 28", 6-PLY SHT		SHT	40259	154	0.28	0.24	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	10.39	NO BID	NO BID
						sold 10 shts/pkg					25/pk		
84	CALCULATOR/ADDING MACHINE ROLLS, WHITE 2 1/4" X 150', 100 RLS/CS		CASE	14001	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
85	PAPER - MANILA OAK TAG MEDIUM WEIGHT 18" X 24", 100 SHT/PKG		PKG	40003	4	10.22	9.64	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	13.03	NO BID	8.27
86	PAPER - MANILA OAK TAG MEDIUM WEIGHT 24" X 36", 100 SHT/PKG		PKG	40006	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
87	ART KRAFT PAPER ROLL, 48" X 200', WHITE		ROLL	39315	2	13.89	16.26	NO BID	NO BID	22.51	17.87	NO BID	11.87
										pacon			
88	ART KRAFT PAPER ROLL, 48" X 200', BROWN		ROLL	39316	1	15.01	17.22	NO BID	NO BID	28.49	17.87	NO BID	NO BID

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT JOINT PURCHASING

GENERAL SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING						CASCADE SCHOOL SUPPLIES	KURTZ BROS	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	QUILL CORP	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	STANDARD STATIONERY	W.B. MASON
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	KURTZ NO.	NUMBER ORDERED								
89	ART KRAFT PAPER ROLL, 48" X 200', CANARY YLW		ROLL		0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
90	ART KRAFT PAPER ROLL, 48" X 200', RED		ROLL	39317	1	16.43	22.79	NO BID	NO BID	29.22	17.87	NO BID	15.05
91	ART KRAFT PAPER ROLL, 48" X 200', AUTUMN		ROLL	39326	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
92	ART KRAFT PAPER ROLL, 48" X 200', LIGHT BLUE		ROLL	39322	1	27.06	21.81	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	17.87	NO BID	NO BID
93	ART KRAFT PAPER ROLL, 48" X 200', DARK BLUE		ROLL	39323	1	15.24	17.59	NO BID	NO BID	24.44	17.87	NO BID	NO BID
94	ART KRAFT PAPER ROLL, 48" X 200', LT GREEN		ROLL		0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
95	ART KRAFT PAPER ROLL, 48" X 200', EMERALD GRN		ROLL	39321	1	14.65	16.95	NO BID	NO BID	24.42	17.87	NO BID	11.94
96	ART KRAFT PAPER ROLL, 48" X 200', ORANGE		ROLL	39319	1	16.61	21.66	NO BID	NO BID	30.67	NO BID	NO BID	14.52
97	ART KRAFT PAPER ROLL, 48" X 200', PINK		ROLL		0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
98	ART KRAFT PAPER ROLL, 48" X 200', BLACK		ROLL	39325	2	15.93	18.69	NO BID	NO BID	26.25	17.87	NO BID	13.39
99	ART KRAFT PAPER ROLL, 48" X 200', PURPLE		ROLL	39327	2	16.48	21.97	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	17.87	NO BID	NO BID
100	PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, 16 OZ., GREEN		BTL	46622	5	1.44	1.30	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	5.49	1.00	0.99
						sargent	sargent						

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT JOINT PURCHASING

GENERAL SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING						CASCADE SCHOOL SUPPLIES	KURTZ BROS	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	QUILL CORP	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	STANDARD STATIONERY	W.B. MASON
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	KURTZ NO.	NUMBER ORDERED								
101	PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, 16 OZ., BLUE		BTL	46626	3	1.44	1.30	NO BID	0.95	2.11	5.49	1.00	0.99
						sargent	sargent		prang	sargent	crayola	prang	prang
102	PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, 16 OZ., VIOLET		BTL	46631	3	1.15	1.30	NO BID	0.95	2.11	5.49	NO BID	0.99
						sargent	sargent		prang	sargent	crayola		prang
103	PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, 16 OZ., BROWN		BTL	46637	2	1.44	1.30	NO BID	0.95	2.11	5.49	1.00	0.99
						sargent	sargent		prang	sargent	crayola	prang	prang
104	PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, 16 OZ., WHITE		BTL	46641	7	1.44	1.30	NO BID	0.95	2.11	5.49	1.00	0.99
						sargent	sargent		prang	sargent	crayola	prang	prang
105	PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, 16 OZ., BLACK		BTL	46643	3	1.44	1.30	NO BID	0.95	2.11	5.49	1.00	0.99
						sargent	sargent		prang	sargent	crayola	prang	prang
106	PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, 16 OZ., ORANGE		BTL	46617	3	1.44	1.30	NO BID	0.95	2.11	5.49	1.00	0.99
						sargent	sargent		prang	sargent	crayola	prang	prang
107	PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, 16 OZ., RED		BTL	46611	3	1.44	1.30	NO BID	0.95	2.11	5.49	1.00	0.99
						sargent	sargent		prang	sargent	crayola	prang	prang
108	PAINT, TEMPERA LIQUID, 16 OZ., YELLOW		BTL	46620	3	1.44	1.30	NO BID	0.95	2.11	5.49	1.00	0.99
						sargent	sargent		prang	sargent	crayola	prang	prang
109	INDEX CARDS, RULED 3" X 5", 100/PKG		PKG	13002	54	0.46	0.35	NO BID	NO BID	0.47	0.53	NO BID	0.39
110	INDEX CARDS, RULED 4" X 6", 100/PKG		PKG	13031	23	0.61	0.66	NO BID	NO BID	0.84	1.15	NO BID	0.69
111	INDEX CARDS, RULED 5" X 8", 100/PKG		PKG	13061	7	0.90	0.98	NO BID	NO BID	1.17	2.19	NO BID	1.06
112	INDEX CARD PLASTIC FILE BOX, 4" X 6"		EACH	13176	6	2.99	2.39	NO BID	2.49	2.58	3.02	NO BID	3.03
										oxford - black			

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT JOINT PURCHASING

GENERAL SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING													
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	KURTZ NO.	NUMBER ORDERED	CASCADE SCHOOL SUPPLIES	KURTZ BROS	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	QUILL CORP	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	STANDARD STATIONERY	W.B. MASON
113	INDEX CARD PLASTIC FILE BOX, 5" X 8"		EACH	13177	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
114	MULTIPURPOSE LASER/INKJET LABELS 1" X 2 5/8", 30/SHT, 750/BX		BOX	14544	25	3.37	2.18	NO BID	2.99	12.59	9.73	1.24	1.94
										avery			
115	MULTIPURPOSE LASER/INKJET LABELS 1" X 4", 14/SHT, 2,000/BX		BOX	14546	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
116	MULTIPURPOSE LASER/INKJET LABELS 2" X 4", 10/SHT, 1,000/BX		BOX	14548	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
117	POST-IT NOTES OR EQUAL, 1 1/2" X 2", 90 SHTS/PAD, 12 PADS/PKG, ASST COLORS	SPECIFY BRAND	PKG	12509	15	4.67	5.42	3.80	1.69	6.10	6.65	0.92	1.80
						3M	post-it	3M	3M	post-it	post-it	12 p/pkg beautone	universal
118	POST-IT NOTES OR EQUAL, 3" X 3", 100 SHTS/PAD, 12 PADS/PKG, ASST COLORS	SPECIFY BRAND	PKG	12438	33	11.55	12.18	3.44	1.99	11.38	16.11	1.86	2.25
						3M	post-it	3M	3M	post-it	post-it	12 p/pkg beautone	universal
119	POST-IT NOTES OR EQUAL, 3" X 5", 100 SHTS/PAD, 12 PADS/PKG, ASST COLORS	SPECIFY BRAND	PKG	12510	17	5.96	6.95	NO BID	6.19	NO BID	NO BID	7.94	6.23
						3M 5 per/pkg	post-it 5 per/pkg		3M 5 per/pkg			12 p/pkg beautone	3M 5 per/pkg
120	POST-IT NOTES OR EQUAL, RULED, 4" X 6", 100 SHTS/PAD, 5 PADS/PKG, ASST COLORS	SPECIFY BRAND	PKG		1	6.23	NO BID	NO BID	9.79	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	9.75
						3M 3 per/pkg			3M 5/pkg				universal 5 p/pkg
121	POST-IT COVER UP TAPE, 1 LINE, 1/6" X 700"		ROLL	12498	12	1.46	1.67	NO BID	1.59	1.72	2.63	1.30	1.59
						post-it			post-it	post-it		post-it	
122	POST-IT COVER UP TAPE, 6 LINE, 1" X 700"		ROLL	12423	10	2.72	3.22	NO BID	2.89	3.24	5.05	NO BID	2.72
						post-it	post-it		post-it	post-it	post-it		post-it
123	EASEL PAD SELF STICK, NO RULE, WHITE, 25" X 30"	SPECIFY BRAND	PAD	11488	6	20.00	21.65	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	12.69	NO BID
						3M	post-it					beautone	
124	WITE-OUT CORRECTION FLUID, WHITE, .7 OZ.	SPECIFY BRAND	EACH	05409	40	0.46	0.96	NO BID	0.45	0.98	NO BID	0.49	0.51
						cascade	bic		planet pleaser	bic		wite-out 39-corrector	bic

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT JOINT PURCHASING

GENERAL SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING						CASCADE SCHOOL SUPPLIES	KURTZ BROS	NATIONAL ART & SCHOOL SUPPLIES	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	QUILL CORP	SCHOOL SPECIALTY	STANDARD STATIONERY	W.B. MASON
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	KURTZ NO.	NUMBER ORDERED								
138	MINUTE BOOK 396-11 - THREE POST BINDER 8 1/2" X 11" W/LOCKING MECHANISM	SPECIFY BRAND	EACH	16064	2	NO BID	124.32	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	256.68	NO BID	126.84
							acco				wilson jones		wilson jones
139	MINUTE BOOK REFILL SHEETS 903-10, 100 SHTS/PKG		PKG	16057	4	NO BID	36.67	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	36.85
													wilson jones
140	STRING/BTN STORAGE BXS LTR SZ - 12 P/CTN - 10"H X 12"W X 24"D, MIN 350LB STK WGT		CTN		3	79.08	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	41.88	NO BID	NO BID	44.27
										quill			