

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT #10 - JOINT PURCHASING

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING					CENTRAL POLY CORP	CLEARFIELD WHOLESALE PAPER CO	COOPER FRIEDMAN ELECTRIC SUPPLY	JANITORS SUPPLY	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	SCOTT ELECTRIC	W.B. MASON
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	NUMBER ORDERED							
9	WINDOW CLEANER, WINDEX	NO SUBS	GAL	10	NO BID	8.60	NO BID	8.75	16.98	NO BID	9.15
10	BLEACH, PLASTIC, 5.75% SODIUM HYPOCHLORITE, 6 GAL/CASE		CASE	55	NO BID	12.50	NO BID	8.94	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
11	DEICER, OSSIAN "ICE FOE"	NO SUBS	DRUM	60	NO BID	44.76	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
12	SPRAY BOTTLE, POLYETHYLENE 22 OZ. WITH ADJ. NOZZLE & TRIGGER SPRAY	SUBMIT SAMPLE	EACH	74	NO BID	0.90	NO BID	NO BID	0.87	NO BID	0.72
13	SYNTHETIC DISPOSABLE GLOVES, SIZE LARGE BEADED CUFF, POWDER FREE, 100/BOX	SUBMIT SAMPLE	BOX	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
14	VINYL GLOVES, AMBIDEXTROUS SMALL, BEADED CUFF POWDER FREE, 100/BOX	SUBMIT SAMPLE	BOX	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
15	VINYL GLOVES, AMBIDEXTROUS MEDIUM, BEADED CUFF POWDER FREE, 100/BOX	SUBMIT SAMPLE	BOX	2	NO BID	2.40	NO BID	2.20	2.35	NO BID	1.79
16	VINYL GLOVES, AMBIDEXTROUS LARGE, BEADED CUFF POWDER FREE, 100/BOX	SUBMIT SAMPLE	BOX	2	NO BID	2.40	NO BID	2.20	2.35	NO BID	1.79

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT #10 - JOINT PURCHASING

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING					CENTRAL POLY CORP	CLEARFIELD WHOLESALE PAPER CO	COOPER FRIEDMAN ELECTRIC SUPPLY	JANITORS SUPPLY	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	SCOTT ELECTRIC	W. B. MASON
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	NUMBER ORDERED							
17	VINYL GLOVES, AMBIDEXTROUS X-LARGE, BEADED CUFF POWDER FREE, 100/BOX	SUBMIT SAMPLE	BOX	16	NO BID	2.40	NO BID	2.20	2.35	NO BID	1.79
											lightly powdered
18	RUBBER GLOVES, SMALL, 18 MIL, 12" L, EMBOSSED HAND PAD COTTON FLOCK LINED, RUBBERMAID, 2/SET	SUBMIT SAMPLE	SET	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
19	RUBBER GLOVES, MEDIUM, 18 MIL, 12" L, EMBOSSED HAND PAD COTTON FLOCK LINED, RUBBERMAID, 2/SET	SUBMIT SAMPLE	SET	15	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	0.84	0.75	NO BID	1.08
											priced 2/pk, sold 12/pk
20	RUBBER GLOVES, LARGE, 18 MIL, 12" L, EMBOSSED HAND PAD COTTON FLOCK LINED, RUBBERMAID, 2/SET	SUBMIT SAMPLE	SET	25	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	0.84	0.75	NO BID	0.94
											priced 2/pk, sold 12/pk
21	RUBBER GLOVES, X-LARGE, 18 MIL, 12" L, EMBOSSED HAND PAD COTTON FLOCK LINED, RUBBERMAID, 2/SET	SUBMIT SAMPLE	SET	25	NO BID	0.65	NO BID	0.84	0.75	NO BID	NO BID
22	WOOD HANDLE, WAREHOUSE, INDUSTRIAL SIZE (or EQUAL)	SUBMIT SPEC SHEET	EACH	14	NO BID	NO BID	10.10	3.56	5.05	NO BID	NO BID
23	ANGLED BROOM, FLOOR, POLYPROPYLENE FILL 1" DIAMETER HANDLE, RUBBERMAID 6377	SUBMIT SPEC SHEET	EACH	24	NO BID	5.59	4.70	4.91	3.98	NO BID	NO BID
24	PUSH BROOM, 24" BLACK POLYPROPYLENE FILL, FLOOR, W/STRUCTURAL FOAM BLOCK W/54" HANDLE, MED BRISTLES, R-MAID	SUBMIT SPEC SHEET	EACH	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
25	PUSH BROOM, 36" BLACK POLYPROPYLENE FILL, FOR SMOOTH FLR, STRUCTURAL FOAM BLOCK W/54" HANDLE, FINE BRISTLE, R-MAID	SUBMIT SPEC SHEET	EACH	1	NO BID	NO BID	11.16	17.96	16.98	NO BID	NO BID

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT #10 - JOINT PURCHASING

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING					CENTRAL POLY CORP	CLEARFIELD WHOLESALE PAPER CO	COOPER FRIEDMAN ELECTRIC SUPPLY	JANITORS SUPPLY	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	SCOTT ELECTRIC	W. B. MASON
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	NUMBER ORDERED							
26	STREET BROOM 16" WITH 5" TRIM, WOOD BLOCK, POLYPROPYLENE FILL WITH HANDLE, RUBBERMAID	SUBMIT SPEC SHEET	EACH	1	NO BID	NO BID	11.75	13.20	8.39	NO BID	NO BID
27	DUST PAN HEAVY DUTY, RUBBERMAID 2005	SUBMIT SPEC SHEET	EACH	32	NO BID	1.69	1.45	1.51	1.62	NO BID	2.40
28	BUCKET/WRINGER COMBO (1) 35 QT. BUCKET W/3" CASTERS AND (1) 16-32 OZ. DOWNWARD PRESSURE WRINGER, RUBBERMAID # 7577	NO SUBSTITUTE	EACH	4	NO BID	84.80	69.82	71.46	55.98	NO BID	78.81
29	WASTE BASKET, RECTANGULAR, 41 QT., GRAY CONTINENTAL # 4114 or EQUAL, 15.25" X 19 7/8"	SUBMIT SPEC SHEET	EACH	52	NO BID	5.85	5.88	5.84	5.89	NO BID	4.62
30	CONTAINER, 32 GAL GRAY PLASTIC, RUBBERMAID, 2632	SUBMIT SPEC SHEET	EACH	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
31	CONTAINER, 35 GAL, OUTSIDE WITH LID HINGED TOP, SPRING LOADED DOORS, FIRE RESISTANT, GRAY, RUBBERMAID: 8430	SUBMIT SPEC SHEET	EACH	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
32	ENDS, WHITE, SEWN BOTTOM, FULLER MODEL 22916BL (or EQUAL)	SUBMIT SAMPLE	EACH	12	NO BID	2.25	3.75	2.50	3.59	NO BID	NO BID
33	MOP HEAD, 5" HEAD BAND, 20 OZ. COTTON LOOPED ENDS, WHITE, SEWN BOTTOM, FULLER MODEL 28520BB (or EQUAL)	SUBMIT SAMPLE	EACH	36	NO BID	2.60	4.22	3.12	3.89	NO BID	NO BID
34	MOP HEAD, 5" HEAD BAND, 24 OZ. COTTON LOOPED ENDS, WHITE, SEWN BOTTOM, FULLER MODEL 28524BB (or EQUAL)	SUBMIT SAMPLE	EACH	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
35	SAFETY GLASSES, EQUAL TO ANSI 287.11, CLEAR LENS, FLEX FRAMS, UNIV NOSE BRIDGE, CLOSE FIT SIDE SHIELDS, CURVED FRONT FRAME	SUBMIT SAMPLE	EACH	46	NO BID	1.28	NO BID	2.06	1.38	NO BID	0.96
36	WET FLOOR CAUTION SIGN, RUBBERMAID, 6/CASE		CASE	6	NO BID	8.95	6.37	6.52	29.34	NO BID	10.12
						each	each	each	must buy by the case		continental - ca
37	ABSORBENT DEOD COMPOUND, ABSORP/DEOD OF VOMIT HUMAN/ANIMAL EXCREMENT/OTHER TYPES OF ODOR (VOBAN), (1) 25 LB. BX		BOX	6	NO BID	41.00	NO BID	NO BID	47.25	NO BID	NO BID

CENTRAL INTERMEDIATE UNIT #10 - JOINT PURCHASING

CUSTODIAL SUPPLIES - 2019/2020 JOINT PURCHASING					CENTRAL POLY CORP	CLEARFIELD WHOLESALE PAPER CO	COOPER FRIEDMAN ELECTRIC SUPPLY	JANITORS SUPPLY	PYRAMID SCHOOL PRODUCTS	SCOTT ELECTRIC	W.B. MASON
#	DESCRIPTION	OTHER	UNIT	NUMBER ORDERED							
38	9" VOLT ALKALINE ENERGIZER BATTERY	SPECIFY BRAND	EACH	59	NO BID	1.21	1.67	NO BID	0.95	1.08	1.02
						energizer	duracell		energizer		energizer, priced each, sold 12/pk
39	AA" ALKALINE ENERGIZER BATTERY	SPECIFY BRAND	EACH	770	NO BID	0.31	0.39	NO BID	0.26	0.27	0.24
						energizer	duracell		energizer		energizer, priced each sold 24/pk
40	AAA" ALKALINE ENERGIZER BATTERY	SPECIFY BRAND	EACH	390	NO BID	0.31	0.40	NO BID	0.26	0.27	0.24
						energizer	duracell		energizer		energizer, priced each sold 24/pk
41	C" ALKALINE ENERGIZER BATTERY	SPECIFY BRAND	EACH	0	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS	NO ORDERS
42	D" ALKALINE ENERGIZER BATTERY	SPECIFY BRAND	EACH	96	NO BID	0.98	0.85	NO BID	0.84	0.88	0.70
						energizer	duracell		energizer		energizer, priced each, sold 12/pk